
Servicing 

Service book check – Oil change – Replacement of filters – 
leveling of all fluids (cooling, windscreen cleaner, brakes) - 24 
check points (lights, tyres, brake pads, steering system , shock 
absorbers, wiper blades...), Identification of wear points and 
replacement of defective or worn parts (spark plugs, timing belt, 
brake pads and discs ...)

Inspection and Maintenance

Fault diagnosis - Visual inspection (mechanical check) - 
Identification of mechanical faults and future repairs.

Brake system and Service

Complete verification of the entire braking system - Identification 
and replacement

Lighting

In and out verification of the entire lighting system - Replacement 
of altered components - Technologically-assisted adjustment and 
optimization of lighting...

Battery, starter and charging system

Checkup of the battery’s condition – Check of alternator charging 
– Check of the alternator belt – Check the starting system. Print 
out report for electrical system.

Fault Diagnosis

Specific technologically assisted diagnostics – Identification of 
malfunctions – Identification of altered parts and components – 
Identification of interventions to be planned in order of priority…

Maintenance of electronic systems

Comprehensive diagnosis of all electronic systems of the vehicle 
– Advanced control procedures and technologies – Inspection of 
faulty code in the vehicle’s engine control unit – Interpretation of 
dashboard lights – Clearing of sporadic fault codes – Reporting 
of faults recorded

Air conditioning service

Continuous diagnosis and continuous optimisation of the air-
conditioning system - Complete ‘one-stop-shop’ service: pressure 
test - Leak detection - Recharge in gas and oil

Tyre service

Complete pneumatic service, from assembly to balancing - “Tyre 
Life” personalised support program - Pirelli brand partner...
 

Steering and Suspension

Comprehensive, technologically assisted, diagnostic of the entire 
suspension and steering system - Identification & planning of 
future interventions in order of priority...

Parts & accessories

Automotive spare parts: from wipers to vehicle bulbs, and brakes 
to batteries, Bosch Car Service offers a wide range of high quality 
Bosch automotive parts. You will also find a comprehensive 
selection of parts from our premium partner brands, which help 
make driving safe, enjoyable and environmentally friendly.

Our Services

Everything we do for your car, we do for you.


